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A White

From: "A White" <rifle@telus.net>

Date: April 28, 2020 6:37 PM

To: "Gert Odendaal" <godendaal@hotmail.com>

Attach: Canadian Magnum Cartridges 001 jpg; 375 CDN Loading Data.pdf
Subject:  Re: .338-404 Imperial caliber

Hi Gert; The attachments show the dimensions of the .375 Canadian Magnum.cartridge.
based on the .404 Jeffery and some load data. Not sure-if this-is what you are looking

If it is | have RCBS loading dies, Clymer chambering reamers and Go, NoGo gauges
available for sale.

Hope this helps. Let me know.

Stay Safe; Aubrey

From: Gert Odendaal

Sent: Tuesday, April 28, 2020 6:06 AM
To: Aubrey White

Subject: Re: .338-404 Imperial caliber

Hallo Aubrey, | believe all is good on your side? Aubrey, six years ago | send you an email in regards to
the Imperial Magnums developed by you...Aubrey, | still want to build a Imperial Magnum , but in a93
caliber, using a original 404 Jeffery case without any changes.....dé'youhave-a'lmperialMagnum-
reamer in this caliber range to the 9.5 cal with a 404 Jeffery case ..."

I really would appreciate it if | can purchase such a reamer and possibly re-loading dies...or can you

give me any person who might have bought the reamers/dies in 1989 and still have it available to sell
to me??

Regards

Gert Odendaal

From: Gert Odendaal <godendaal@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 05 February 2014 12:26

To: rifle@persona.ca <rifle@persona.ca>; rifle@telus.net <rifle@telus.net>
Subject: RE: .338-404 Imperial caliber

Good day to you Aubrey

| am impress with the performance of this rifle regarding its load specifications. | definitely want to
build myself such a calibre. What will be the easiest route to get the reamers, re-loading dies , forming
dies and go/no go gauges. Is it possible to purchase these items from your company?

Kind Regards

2020-04-28



Liﬂe@telus.net
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From: Gert Odendaal <godendaal@hotmail.com>
Sent: April 29, 2020 12:05 PM
To: rifle@telus.net
Subject: Re: .338-404 Imperial caliber

Aubrey, do you still have your 338-404 Imperial Magnum rifle???
From: Gert Odendaal <godendaal@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 April 2020 20:13

To: rifle@telus.net <rifle@telus.net>

Subject: Re: .338-404 Imperial caliber

Aubrey, good, | am interested to purchase the whole set. | will ask my brother in law to send you a cheque
for the amount of $80 to you as a deposit as soon as you can provide me with your street /residence
address......would you consider keeping all the components for me, until next year February 22 nd ..| am
receiving my bonus then and complete the whole payment...Are your residing in Canada? If so | will give you
an address of a visiting hunter from Canada that can bring me the items to South Africa when he visit next
year to hunt...

I would like to hear from you.
Regards

Gert Odendaal

From: rifle@telus.net <rifle@telus.net>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 April 2020 17:59

To: 'Gert Odendaal' <godendaal@hotmail.com>
Subject: .338-404 Imperial caliber

Hi Gert; Price for the reamer, dies and gauges would be $275.00 plus shipping — | will need your postal code for
shipping costs. 1also have 40 RWS .404] fully formed and once fired SiCanadiancases. This brass is the best | ever
used for the Imperial and Canadian cartridges — very tough and long lasting. Cost of the 40 cases will be $80.00. {

should mention you need a #26 RCS shell holder for your loading press for these RWS cases which | will include if you
want the cases.

From: Gert Odendaal <godendaal@hotmail.com>
Sent: April 28, 2020 11:29 PM

To: A White <rifle@telus.net>

Subject: Re: .338-404 Imperial caliber

Hallo Aubrey , great to hear from you again, Aubrey what price will you ask for the reamer and re-loading dies
and go/no go gauges???

From: A White <rifle@telus.net>
Sent: Wednesday, 29 April 2020 03:37



